
817

SUPPLEMENT to the Solomon Islands Gazette

Tuesday 8th November, 2022 S.1. No. 216

[Legal Notice No. 260]

CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES (TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF SERVICE) 
(SPEAKER) (AMENDMENT) REGULATIONS 2022

Table of provisions
1  Citation  ........................................................................................................... 817
2  Commencement  .............................................................................................. 817
3  Principal Regulations amended  ...................................................................... 817
4  Regulation 4 repealed and substituted  ............................................................ 818
5  Regulation 6 amended  .................................................................................... 818
6  Regulation 7 amended  .................................................................................... 818
7  Regulation 9 amended  .................................................................................... 818
8  Regulation 14 amended  .................................................................................. 818
9  Regulation 15 amended  .................................................................................. 818
10  Regulation 17 repealed and substituted  .......................................................... 818
11  Regulation 23 amended  .................................................................................. 818
12  Regulation 24 amended  .................................................................................. 819
13  New regulation 25  .......................................................................................... 819

CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES (TERMS AND CONDITIONS  
OF SERVICES) ACT  

(Cap. 84)

CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES (TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF SERVICE) 
(SPEAKER) (AMENDMENT) REGULATIONS 2022

I, Hon. Prime Minister, Manasseh Damukana Sogavare, under section 3 of the 
Constitutional Offices (Terms and Conditions of Service) Act (Cap. 84), the Prime 
Minister makes the following Regulations:

1  Citation
These Regulations may be cited as the Constitutional Offices (Terms and 
Conditions of Service) (Speaker) (Amendment) Regulations 2022.

2  Commencement
These Regulations commence on the date they are published in the Gazette.

3  Principal Regulations amended
These regulations amend the Constitutional Offices (Terms and Conditions 
of Service) (Speaker) Regulations 1990 (“Principal Regulations”) (Legal 
Notice No. 144 of 1990).



818

4  Regulation 4 repealed and substituted
The Principal Regulation is amended by repealing regulation 4 and substituting 
the following:

“The speaker shall be paid his or her salary by fortnightly payments of $11 
000.00.”

5  Regulation 6 amended
Regulation 6 of the Principal Regulations is amended by deleting “$15 
000.00” and substituting “$20 000.00”.

6  Regulation 7 amended
Regulation 7 of the Principal Regulations is amended by deleting “$5000.00” 
and substituting “$6500.00”.

7  Regulation 9 amended
The Principal Regulations is amended by deleting regulation 9 and substituting 
the following:

“9(1) The Speaker shall be provided with a vehicle free of charge.

“9(2) If the speaker is not provided with a vehicle free of charge, he or she 
is entitled to:

(a)  monthly vehicle allowance - $6500.00; and

(b)  monthly fuel allowance - $4000.00.”.

8  Regulation 14 amended
Regulation 14 of the Principal Regulations is amended by deleting “$12 
000.00” and substituting “$13 000.00”.

9  Regulation 15 amended
Regulation 15 of the Principal Regulations is amended by deleting “$12 
000.00” and substituting “$13 000.00”.

10  Regulation 17 repealed and substituted
The Principal Regulations is amended by repealing regulation 17 and 
substituting the following new regulation 17:

“17. The speaker shall be entitled to an annual medical expense of $14 
000.00.”

11  Regulation 23 amended
Regulation 23 of the Principal Regulations is amended by deleting “$15 
000.00” and substituting “$18 000.00”.



819

12  Regulation 24 amended
Regulation 24 of the Principal Regulations is amended by deleting “$2000.00” 
and substituting “$3000.00”.

13  New regulation 25
The Principal Regulations is amended by inserting after regulation 24 the 
following new regulation:

“25.  For each term of Parliament the speaker is entitled to a mobile handset 
worth $4000.00 payable under the budget head of the National 
Parliament.”.

Made in Honiara this eighth-day of November 2022.

HON. MANASSEH DAMUKANA SOGAVARE
PRIME MINISTER

[Legal Notice No. 261]

CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES (TERMS AND CONDITIONS  
OF SERVICES) ACT 

(Cap. 84)

CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES (TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF SERVICES) 
(ANNUAL SALARY) (SPEAKER) ORDER 2022

I, Hon. Manasseh Damukana Sogavare, Prime Minister, under section 2 of the 
Constitutional Offices (Terms and Conditions of Services) Act (Cap. 84), prescribe 
$286 000.00 to be the annual salary payable to the speaker.

Made in Honiara this eighth-day of November 2022.

HON. MANASSEH DAMUKANA SOGAVARE
PRIME MINISTER



Honiara, Solomon Islands
Printed under the authority of the  

Solomon Islands Government

Printed by Provincial Press


