
SUPPLEMENT to the Solomon Islands Gazette 

Wednesday 7th  January, 2009 	 S.I. No. 1 

[Legal Notice No. 1] 

PRICE CONTROL ACT 
(Cap. 64) 

THE PRICE CONTROL (APPLICATION TO GOODS AND 
RESTRICTION OF PRICES) (AMENDMENT) (NO.14) ORDER 2008. 

IN exercise of the powers conferred by sections 4 and 6 of the Price Control Act, 
and after consultations with the Prices Advisory Committee, I, FRANCIS BILLY 
HILLY, Minister of Commerce, Employment and Industries, do hereby make the 
foliowing Order - 

This Order may be cited as the Price Control (Application to Goods and 
Restriction of Prices) (Amendment) (No.14) Order 2008 and shall come 
into operation on 1 January 2009. 

2. 	Schedule 3 to the Price Control (Application to Goods and Restriction of 
Prices) Order 1987*  is hereby amended by deleting serial No. 13 thereof 
arid substituting therefor the following - 

"13 PETROLEUM PRODUCTS 

WHOLESALE 	RETAIL 
(maximum price in 	(maximum price in 
cents per litre) 	cents per litre) 

(a) Petroleum Motor Spirit 
- (PMS) 	522.56 	660.9 

(b) Distillate 	- (ADO) 	620.08 	773.1 
(c) Kerosene 	- (KERO) 	656.21 	(maximum percentage 

mark-up) 

-cost into store plus 15% 
for sales of packaged 
product 

-cost into store plus 20% 
for break-bulk sales." 

Daied at Honiara this twentieth-fourth day of December, 2008. 

FRANCIS BILLY HILLY 
Minister of Commerce. Employment and Industries 

*LNNO47/87 p.104 



2 

[Legal Notice No. 2] 

HONIARA CITY ACT 1999 
(No.2 of 1999) 

The Honiara City Council 
2009 Rates and Charges Amendment Ordinance 

AN ORDINANCE 

TO 

Amend those specific fees, rates and charges so listed in the Honiara City Council 
tB`y--Ua—ws`_53yhe amounts prescribed in the Schedules for 
a 	o a so set out the Business Licence fees applicable for the 2009 financial 
year. 

Enacted by the Honiara City Council with the Assent of the Minister as follows: 

This Ordinance may be cited as the Honiara City Council 2009 Rates and 
Charges Amendment Ordinance and shall come into effect from Ist  
January 2009 and after it is assented to by the Minister of Home Affairs 
in accordance with section 21 (1) of the Honiara City Act 1999. 

2. 	This Ordinance is to be read in conjunction with relevant Honiara City 
Council by-laws and only those items specifically mentioned in 
Schedule I are hereby amended for 2009 by this Ordinance, whilst all 
other fees, rates and charges and fines contained therein each relevant 
Honiara City Council by-law remains the same for 2009, unless altered 
by any subsequent Ordinance. 

Schedule 2 of this Ordinance sets out the Honiara City Council Business 
Licence fees for 2009. 

Passed and adopted by the Honiara City Council this 6th  day of October 2008 

Cr. Andrew Mua 
Mayor 

Honiara City Council 

Assented by the Honourable Minister for Minister for Home Affairs this 30th 
day of December 2008. 

Minister 
Ministry of Home Affairs 



3 

di) 

.0c 
0 0 

C-) 
o 

H 
C! C' 

c 
© 0 00 
© If) 

IDS 
Ifl 

611) Os 6s6g) 
ME 



1-4 
>- 

0 000 

1iH 0 rj 	 ) 

00 
0 00 

0 0 00 0 Coco  00000 	 0 
— ç' 	N— — — — — ir 	- - ,—i 	 , .- 	 .—i j- 

C/ Z cl (# (# C/i Z 	C/i C) 	C/i cf C/i  
+- +- 	+- 	. 	_ 	_ _ 	_ 	 I .  +- 	Q) •) &) 

4__4 

	

11:5 11:5 	 000 
0 00  

—4--------- - 	C) C) C) 
C/DC/D&D 

0 	 a) 
cz 

0 	 cm - — 
C/iCd) 

ID 	cz 1 	 C/) 
000 — - 

z II  

to 	ou 	•
C/) 

C,) 	 bO 
C/i 

-- 04, 
_v_0 

cz 4 0 	C) 
C/)/iC/)ç/iO 	 0Q) 



5 

- 	0 
C13 	11  (UC 

• cj -:, >j 
Ii Ca. u 

. 0 0r: q to to 
00 

CCC 

;.L_. 
)) 

u ) o 
0000 coo CC C C C C 

V)—  
LS IDS els I&S 

— C\ - — N - tI 

0 

— 
0 

0 
0 

o 
c0000 00 

0 
C-) 

0 — 
LOO 03 

-- 

C.) (l 
C c, 	- 	C c. 	i-. — 
' 	'i -f - 

• 0 
cz 'C) 

-) 
r.  E 

C) 

00•— 
V) CZ u E-H 

0C'- 
0 

cc7j 
Z4 Ln uo 

Cfs 
c_) - 
— 

0 

- 
0 

C) 

L) 
'5 
C.) 

C.) 
C-,) 

= 
C 



ri 

0 
ocl  - 

--- 1) U) 
Lr)Lfl C.) tj ti to, 

;-4 ;-. -I 

0 c. 
00000c co o o oc oo 0 0 0 0 fl 0 'fl 00 

C) 	 — 
C! 

ct 

[.L 

•. 	•-J 	- 
C4 	Ln 	CIO 

UC 
- - '—I 
Qk -  

.- 
E L 
ci 

0 

' 
44 

-• 
0 

C$•( 

un 



7 

) 
c 

U 

J — UID L)#D 
i) rID 

arID Uz rID — 
0 0 

c cc 0 
U 

0 rID 
C 

t#D 

to r' o 
C 

c1  
C 

}0 6A.Q Q 

D/D 

0 
V 

V 

C 	— 
o 

U - _ 4- 

U 

I 
U V 

U 

Cd cr3 
U i - DID rID - cr3 cr3 



8 

[Legal Notice No. 7  

CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES (TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF 

SERVICE) ACT 
(CAP. 84) 

CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES (TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF 
SERVICE) (OMBUDSMAN) (AMENDMENT) REGULATIONS 2009 

IN exercise of the powers conferred upon me by section 3 of the Constitutional 

Offices (Terms and Conditions of Service) Act, I make these Regulations -• 

	

1. 	These Regulations are cited the Constitutional Offices (Terms 
cme1cerTnc 

and Conditions of Service) (Ombudsman) (Amendment) Regulations 2009, and 

are deemed to have come into force on 1 January 2008. 

Re"uiaon 4 	
2. 	Regulation 4 of the Constitutional Offices (Terms and Conditions 

m'nded 

	

	of Service) (Ombudsman) Regulations is amended in by deleting "$4,000" and 

substituting "$5,000". 

Dated at. Honiara this thirteenth day of February, 2009. 

Dr. Derek Sikua 
PRTh.E MINISTER 

[Legal Ntice No. 81 

CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES (TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF 
SERVICE ACT 

(CAP. 84) 

CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES (TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF 
SERVICE) (PUISNE JUDGES) (AMENDMENT) REGULATIONS 2009 

IN exercise of the powers Conferred upon me by section 3 of the Constitutional 
Offices (Terms and Conditions of Service) Act, I make these Regulations -- 



we  

0000 00000000000000000000000 QQQ000c0o00000000000co0oco© 
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 C 0 0 0 00 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 C 0

"It CO 00CC0C0CNQC0C0 
\ 

4 4 

00 

00 
0 - 

00E0 u U 
-- 
00 

00 
Ti) 

T 00 -0 	-'-b- 
.- C 

0 
Ti) 0< 	C) C) a 	r4 o 

QQl)rfj O Q<<c' 
00 

(ID 

° 
c L) 

g C 
Iz. 9E C4 oLv U 

Q0 . 

;- — •' 	E . 
Th 0 000 

OO000. 

(ID (ID (ID (ID (A (ID (ID (ID (ID (ID (ID (ID (ID (ID (ID (ID cr DiD (ID f. (ID ID V, DID DID (ID (ID 

000000000000000000000000000 
> > > > > > > > > > > > > > > > > > > > > > > > > 3> $ 
000000000000000000000000000 

	

c zj 	c c c cc c c 	C c c ( ( D 	 ('Di CDi (Di 
000000000000000000000000000 
(ID( (ID (I 	( ID (//D(D(D(D(ID(D(ID /  (I)(ID(DIDr/D ID (ID(ID(I (IDID 
(D (ID ID (ID (ID (I DD (ID (ID (ID (/D (ID /D (/D DID ID (ID c/D (ID ID  (/ 	(ID (I (DID  (ID 

000000000000000000000000000 

	

I.1 a.-, ;- 	-I i-. 	3-I 	3-I 	3-I 3-I 3-I I-I 3-I 1-I 3-I 3-I 3-I 3-I 3-I 3-I 



10 

[Legal Notice No. 10] 

CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES (TERMS AND CONDITIONS 
OF SERVICE) ACT 

(CAP. 84) 

CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES (TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF 
SERVICE) (PUBLIC SOLICITOR) (AMENDMENT) 

REGULATIONS 2009 

IN exercise of the powers conferred upon me by section 3 of the Constitutional 
Offices (Terms and Conditions of Service) Act, I make these Regulations - 

itaUon and 	
1. 	These Regulations are cited the Constitutional Offices (Terms 

)rnrnencetr.ent and Conditions of Service) (Public Solicitor) (Amendment) Regulations 2009, 
and are deemed to have come into force on 1 January 2008. 

	

2. 	Regulation 4 of the Constitutional Offices (Terms and Conditions 
nended 

	

	of Service) (Public Solicitor) Regulations is amended by deleting "$4,000" and 
substituting "$5,000". 

Dated at Honiara this thirteenth day of February, 2009, 

Dr. Derek Sikua 
PRIME MINISTER 

Honiara, Solomon Islands 
Printed under the authority of the 

Solomon Islands Government 

Printed by Solomon Islands Printers Limited. 



11 

CCQOOOCOQO© ooc cco CcCO 
coco oc'rc,  tNoo h 	N N —Coo, ,4 CD  N 

C.) 
4- 

C) 	9 	0 

CI 

cn 

On 

CID 

CIO 

C 
10— 

< 
) 
() C./) 	tV) 

0L)E M o3 

-- 0.0 ca -4___ )COc 
E-v0 

ID JD Cu V 	Cu CI)  Cu Cl) Cl) Cl) Cl) Cl) Cl) Cl) C/) Cl) Cl) Cl) CC) C)) 

C 	-C 	
• 	

I- 
l 	 #.l +- 	+- • _  

C) Cl) C/) Cl) Cl) Cl) C/) Cl) Cl) Cl) CI) C)) Cl) (l) Cl) C)) C)) C)) C)) C)) C)) 

l 	. 	_ 



C"I 

co 

M. 0 

cd 

0 	CO 

- 	VD 

QC 

0 - 
- 	 0 0 

&n 
c 

C/D 	 - 

0 

0 - 	 V 	
- C.) c 	-4 E- 

lu"o  
bf 

V 	
•E E ° 	_ 

12 



13 

0000  
CQCQ 

CCCCCCC 
CQQCCCQ 

C C C C 
CCCC 

000  
CCC 

Q C C C C 
CQCCC 

dood© c" t C C 
Cdcd 

'tOt N C 0000 
dcd 
j-  C' \C 

dd 
110000 CCCCCd C C 00 	oo tt  qQto \ON\CS C\0-4\O cto 

• 
— 

0  
on 

1.) • 	• 
) 	(ID 

QOi 
.•• 	) 

i;flJh 
(ID 00 0 

cd 
--00 ID 

(ID 

-c cz uu u 
to 
.ilh 

(ID C 

bO 
• 0 0 — 

	

(ID 	C 	• (ID E0 Q cz  

— 	.-a 000 — — 
(ID 	(ID 	(ID 	(ID 	(ID 	(ID 	(ID 

0000000 000 
c •ccc 0000000 

000 000000 
0000000 0000 0000 

000 000 
uuuuuuo L4I <<< 



cnfl 	— 

a.) 

a) 
- co 	- 

1-4 1I U l) 	CID 	Cd < 
a) DC#D 

cn 
En On 

ca.) 	 &) 

on cz vs R 
—4 — 	_ c 

CIS 

C) 	C) 	C) • 	• 	• — . — 	- — . - - — CZ C3 S3 W 

0000 O 

00000000000000 

: i 	•-  -1 	
•, —,' — 

14 



15 

HONIARA CITY ACT 1999 
(No. 9 of 1999) 

The Honiara City Council 
Appropriation Ordinance 2009 

AN ORDINANCE 

rs 

Appropriate Twenty Million Nine Hundred and Thirty Six Thousand Nine 
Hundred and Eighty Eight dollars to the services of the financial year ending 315t 
December 2009. 

Enacted by the Honiara City Council with the Assent of the Minister as follows: 

Commencerne, 	 1. 	This Ordinance may be cited as the Honiara City Council 
Appropriation Ordinance 2009 and shall come into effect on the date it is 
assented to by the Minister of Home Affairs in accordance with section 35(2) of 
the Honiara City Act 1999. 

Authorisation of 
the issue o st 	2. 	The issue of the sum of Twenty Million Nine Hundred and Thirty 
$20936988 
from the City 	Six Thousand Nine Hundred and Eighty Eight dollars to the services of the 
Fund 

financial year ending 31 St December 2009. 

	

3. 	The sum specified in the preceding section shall be appropriated 
for the supply of Heads and Subheads specified in the Schedule and in the 
amounts respectively in relation thereto. 

Passed and adopted by the Honiara City Council this 6th day of October 2008. 

Cr. Andrew Mua 
Mayor 

Honiara City Council 

Assented by the Honourable Minister for Minister for Home Affairs this 30th  day 
of December 2008. 

Minister 
Ministry of Home Affairs 



16 

I  
aN 

gçg J  
NOt'Ci ON 

cr eq 
ft 

L) 
ICA 

r' 

C) 

C . 	.-. 

o 
C)! 

c0J)  

I 

C) 
C) — N m t Ln O r-. 00 C\ 

C) C) C) C) C) C) C) C) C)— 
N cn fl N-
C) , r 


